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Attached expense request is for  nt to be used at the   during the 
visit to Palm Beach, Feb 10th‐12th. 
 
C3 Consulting ‐ $2,900 
 

 (b) (6), 
(b) (7)

  

(b) (7)(E) (b) (7)(E)



Auth# _____________________   
  

LAW ENFORCEMENT SENSITIVE  PPD PAER (10/2014) 
 

        
 

PRESIDENTIAL PROTECTIVE DIVISION 
PROTECTIVE ADVANCE EXPENSE REQUEST 

 
 

ADVANCE or SITE AGENT:  Trip# 332-601-035-0020-17-11 
DATE OF VISIT: 2/10/2017 – 2/12/2017 CITY & STATE: Palm Springs, FL 
SITE(s)/LOCATION: Mar a Lago Club 1100 S. Ocean Blvd., Palm Beach FL 
SITE(s)/LOCATION cont’d: N/A COUNTRY:  USA 
VENDOR NAME:   C3 Consulting 
VENDOR TAX ID #:  

VENDOR ADDRESS: 101 Bradley Place, #204, Palm Beach, FL, 33480 
VENDOR CONTACT PERSON:  
VENDOR TELEPHONE NUMBER:  
AUTHORIZED AMOUNT: (Not to Exceed)    

ITEM OR SERVICE:  
PURPOSE OF EXPENDITURE: To provide equipment for .
ADDRESS WHERE EQUIPMENT WILL BE USED OR SERVICES PROVIDED:  

 

PPD REQUISITION NUMBER:    DATE REQUESTED:   

   CHECK THIS BOX IF PAYMENT VIA EMERGENCY PURCHASE ORDER (PURCHASES EXCEEDING $3,000.00) 
EMERGENCY PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER:  DATE APPROVED:    
PROCUREMENT CONTACT PERSON:    
 

PLEASE FORWARD INVOICE TO THE FOLLOWING ADDRESS: 
 
FAX:  (202) 757-1710                             -OR-                COMMUNICATIONS CENTER  (PPD)                    
                                                                                             ATTN:  Budget Coordinator 
                                                                                             P. O. Box 6500 
                                                                                             Springfield, VA  22150 
 
Please note that payment shall be made within 15 days of our receipt of a valid invoice and all required 
vendor information. For fastest service, please fax invoice to the fax number listed above. 
 

OPERATIONS SUPERVISORY APPROVAL OF EXPENDITURE REQUEST: 
 

 

 

DATE OF APPROVAL: 
 

 

APPROVING OFFICIAL AUTHORIZATION FOR EXPENDITURES OF $3,000 OR 
LESS: 
 

 

 

DATE OF APPROVAL: 
 

 

(b) (7)(E)
(b) (7)(E)

(b) (7)(E)
(b) (7)(E)

(b) (6), (b) (7)(C), 
(b) (7)(E)

(b) (4)

(b) (6), (b) (7)(C)

(b) (6), (b) (7)(C)

(b) (6), (b) (7)(C), (b) (7)(E)

(b) (6), (b) (7)(C), (b) (7)(E)
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From:  (PPD)
Sent: Thursday, February 09, 2017 4:54 PM
To:  (PPD); ppdops
Subject: FW: Expense Request - POTUS to Palm Beach, FL Feb 10-12 ( )
Attachments: Protective Advance Expense Request Form ( ) Feb 10-12 2017.doc

 
 
Thx, 
 

 
 

From:  (PPD)  
Sent: Thursday, February 09, 2017 4:47 PM 
To:  (PPD);  (PPD) 
Cc: ppd.budget 
Subject: RE: Expense Request - POTUS to Palm Beach, FL Feb 10-12 ( ) 
 

Funding for this expense request is approved in the amount of $1,305.00. 
  
Please remind the requester to provide the vendor with the appropriate billing information which is 
noted below: 
  
PLEASE FORWARD INVOICE TO ONE OF THE FOLLOWING: 
  
EMAIL                                                -or-                  MAIL 
 

                                 COMMUNICATIONS CENTER (PPD)                       
ATTN:  Budget Coordinator 
P. O. Box 6500 
Springfield, VA  22150 

  
Please note that payment shall be made within 30 days of our receipt of a valid invoice and all 
required vendor information.  For fastest service, please fax invoice to the fax number listed 
above. 
 

From:  (PPD)  
Sent: Thursday, February 09, 2017 4:18 PM 
To:   (PPD)  ;   (PPD) 

 
Subject: FW: Expense Request ‐ POTUS to Palm Beach, FL Feb 10‐12 ( ) 
 
 
 

From:  (PPD)  
Sent: Thursday, February 09, 2017 4:17 PM 
To:  (PPD) 
Subject: Expense Request - POTUS to Palm Beach, FL Feb 10-12 ( ) 

(b) (7)(E)

(b) (7)(E)

(b) (7)(E)
(b) 
(7)(E)

(b) (7)(E)

(b) (7)(E)

(b) (7)(E)

(b) (6), (b) (7)(C), (b) 
(7)(E)

(b) (6), (b) (7)
  

(b) (6), 
(b) (7)

  
(b) (6), (b) (7)(C), (b) (7)

(b) (6), (b) (7)(C), (b) (b) (6), (b) (7)(C), (b) (7)

(
b
 

 

 

 

 

(b) (6), (b) (7)(C), (b) 
(7)(E)

(b) (6), (b) (7)(C), (b) (7)(E) (b) (6), (b) (7)(C), (b) (7)
(E)(b) (6), (b) (7)(C), (b) (7)(E)

(b) (6), (b) (7)
(C)  (b) (7)(E)

(b) (6), (b) (7)(C), (b) 
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, 

 
Attached expense request is for    (Mar‐a‐Lago) during the visit to Palm Beach, Feb 10‐
12. 
 
Frost ‐ $1305 
 

 

(b) (7)(E)

(b) (6), 
(b) (7)

  

(b) (6), 
(b) (7)

  



Auth# _____________________   
  

LAW ENFORCEMENT SENSITIVE  PPD PAER (10/2014) 
 

        
 

PRESIDENTIAL PROTECTIVE DIVISION 
PROTECTIVE ADVANCE EXPENSE REQUEST 

 
 

ADVANCE or SITE AGENT:  Trip # 332-601-035-0020-17-11 
DATE OF VISIT: 2/10/17- 2/12/17 CITY & STATE: West Palm Beach, FL 
SITE(s)/LOCATION: Mar-a-Lago Club, 1100 S. Ocean Boulevard, Palm Beach, FL 33480 
SITE(s)/LOCATION N/A COUNTRY:  USA 
VENDOR NAME: Frost 
VENDOR TAX ID #:  

VENDOR ADDRESS: 704 S. Military Trail Deerfield Beach, FL 
VENDOR CONTACT PERSON:  
VENDOR TELEPHONE NUMBER:  
AUTHORIZED AMOUNT:  $1305.00 
ITEM OR SERVICE:  
 

PURPOSE OF EXPENDITURE:  
                                                          
ADDRESS WHERE EQUIPMENT WILL BE USED OR SERVICES PROVIDED:  

 

PPD REQUISITIONr NUMBER:    DATE REQUESTED:   

   CHECK THIS BOX IF PAYMENT VIA EMERGENCY PURCHASE ORDER (PURCHASES EXCEEDING $3,000.00) 
EMERGENCY PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER:  DATE APPROVED:    
PROCUREMENT CONTACT PERSON:    
 

PLEASE FORWARD INVOICE TO THE FOLLOWING ADDRESS: 
 
FAX:  (202) 757-1710                             -OR-                COMMUNICATIONS CENTER  (PPD)                    
                                                                                             ATTN:  Budget Coordinator 
                                                                                             P. O. Box 6500 
                                                                                             Springfield, VA  22150 
 
Please note that payment shall be made within 15 days of our receipt of a valid invoice and all required 
vendor information. For fastest service, please fax invoice to the fax number listed above. 
 

OPERATIONS SUPERVISORY APPROVAL OF EXPENDITURE REQUEST: 
 

 

 

DATE OF APPROVAL: 
 

 

APPROVING OFFICIAL AUTHORIZATION FOR EXPENDITURES OF $3,000 OR 
LESS: 
 

 

 

DATE OF APPROVAL: 
 

 

(b) (6), (b) (7)(C), (b) 
(7)(E)

(b) (7)(E)

(b) (7)(E)

(b) (7)(E)
(b) (7)(E)

(b) (4)

(b) (6)

(b) (6)

(b) (6), (b) (7)(C), (b) (7)(E)

(b) (6), (b) (7)(C), (b) (7)(E)
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From:  (PPD)
Sent: Thursday, February 09, 2017 3:05 PM
To: ppdops;  (PPD)
Subject: FW: Expense Request - POTUS to Palm Beach, FL Feb 10-12 (  

)

 
 

From:  (PPD)  
Sent: Thursday, February 09, 2017 3:04 PM 
To:  (PPD);  (PPD) 
Cc: ppd.budget 
Subject: RE: Expense Request - POTUS to Palm Beach, FL Feb 10-12 ( ) 
 

Funding for this expense request is approved in the amount of $890.00. 
  
Please remind the requester to provide the vendor with the appropriate billing information which is 
noted below: 
  
PLEASE FORWARD INVOICE TO ONE OF THE FOLLOWING: 
  
EMAIL                                                -or-                  MAIL 
 

                                 COMMUNICATIONS CENTER (PPD)                       
ATTN:  Budget Coordinator 
P. O. Box 6500 
Springfield, VA  22150 

  
Please note that payment shall be made within 30 days of our receipt of a valid invoice and all 
required vendor information.  For fastest service, please fax invoice to the fax number listed 
above. 
 

From:   (PPD)  
Sent: Thursday, February 09, 2017 12:11 PM 
To:  (PPD)  ;   (PPD) 

 
Subject: FW: Expense Request ‐ POTUS to Palm Beach, FL Feb 10‐12 ( ) 
 

From:  (PPD)  
Sent: Thursday, February 09, 2017 12:10 PM 
To:  (PPD) 
Subject: Expense Request - POTUS to Palm Beach, FL Feb 10-12 ) 
 

y, 
 
Attached expense request is for   (Mar‐a‐Lago) during the visit to Palm Beach, Feb 10th‐
12th. 
 

(b) (6), (b) (7)(C), (b) 
(7)(E)

(b) (6), (b) (7)
  

(b) (6), (b) (7)(C), (b) (7)

(b) (6), (b) (7)(C), (b) (b) (6), (b) (7)(C), (b) (7)

(b) (6), (b) (7)(C), (b) 
(7)(E)

(
b
 

 

 

 

 

(b) (6), (b) (7)(C), (b) (7)(E) (b) (6), (b) (7)(C), (b) (7)
(E)

(b) (6), (b) (7)
  

(b) (6), (b) (7)(C), (b) 

(b) (6), 
(b) (7)

  

(b) (7)(E)

(b) (7)(E)

(b) (7)(E)

(b) (7)(E)
(b) (6), (b) (7)(C), (b) (7)(E)

(b) (7)(E)

(b) (7)(E)
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Tidy Coast event Services ‐ $890 
 
 

 (b) (6), 
(b) (7)
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From:  (PPD)
Sent: Wednesday, February 08, 2017 9:23 PM
To: logrc
Cc: opomnpwr1; ppdops;  (PPD)
Subject: PPD Ops Reviewed Rental Vehicle Authorization Form Palm Beach FL (AV#09) (Draft 

4).xlsx
Attachments: PPD Ops Reviewed Rental Vehicle Authorization Form Palm Beach FL (AV#09) (Draft 

4).xlsx

, 
 
Please see PPD Ops Reviewed Rental Vehicle Authorization Form Palm Beach FL (AV#09) (Draft 4).xlsx. 
 
Please note Rentals added on SHEET #2 line 48‐51.   
 
Next actionable item 2/9/17. 
 
R/S 

  
PPD Operations 

 (Cell) 
 (Desk)  

(b) (6), (b) (7)
(C)  (b) (7)(E)

(b) (6), (b) (7)
  

(b) 
(7)

(b) (6), (b) 
(7)(C)  (b) 

(b) (6), (b) (7)
(C)  (b) (7)(E)(b) (6), (b) (7)
(C)  (b) (7)(E)






